
N
lneZ Leona KinhIn, 87, of Iowa

City ahd formerly of Grinnell, died at
~ercy Hosp{tal hospice in Iowa City
on Friday, NoV. 2,2012.

Funeral serviceS were heldN0V.7 at
tensing Funeral & Cremation Service
j~iowaCity, andb&iat”~ atMemotY
GardenS Cenietety. Memod~5 may be
~jjospitalFou~0fl

for Mercy Hospice or Atniunh village.
She was born Dec. 19, 1924, in

Ox ford, Iowa, the daughter of Charles
and Ada Austin. She ~vent to school
hi ~~lliamncbmg~ and later graduated
fromGru1~School. ShemOVCd
to iowa City and worked for the U.S.
Navy, then attended beauty school
jtl°fl~ Mowes
AudreY Austin oitroSc5ft0m~~~1~
VJ&KUI~’ from
3, 1947.5~~beganher career as a~osmetolo

gist in 1944, and continued tending to
her clidnts’ needs until her health no
lunger allowed her to do so. She was
amei4ber oftheNat1o~~t&e55
Assooiat1on~ First united Methodist
Church and the CoralVille American
Legion. She also enjoyed camping~
boating and doing needleW0r~

She is survived by her son Kevin I,
Kimni of Iowa City a brother, Arlo I.
Vaughn’ Austin of ~lingtOn, Texas; ‘I
twosiS!Q’5i Irene TerraZas of Santa Fe,
N.M., and~xi~y ~1ttogge ofGriflnell
and three granddaughters.

inei was preceded in death by her
parents; her husband; two brothers,
Wayne Austin and Clyde Austin; and
a son, Terrance Kimni.


